
Y -q-60--9 

(3) 

RNI No., MAHBIL /2009/87831 

[ys, fAd :54à9.o0 



. 



HIGHER AND TECHNICAL EDUCATION DEPARTMENT 

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, 
Mumbai 400 032, Dated the 3rd July 2023. 

NOTIFICATION 

MAHARASHTRA PUBLIC UNIVERSITIEs AcT, 2016. 

No. Parini-2018/C.R.89/UE-2,- In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (10) of 
section 72 read with sub-section (5) of section 71 of the Maharashtra Public Universities Act, 
2016 (Mah.VI of 2017) the Government of Maharashtra hereby amends the Maharashtra Public 
Universities (Procedure for conduct of business at the Meetings of Authorities of the Üniversity) 
Uniform Statute, 2019, as follows, namely : 

(1) This Statute may be called as the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for 
conduct of business at the meetings of the Authorities of the University) (First Amendment) 
Uniform Statute, 2023. 

(2) In clause 2 of the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for conduct of business 
at the meetings of the authorities of the University) Uniform Statute, 2019, 

(i) in sub-clause (1) for the words «forty clear days", the words "fifteen clear days" 
shall be substituted. 

(iü) in sub-clause (2) for the words "thirty clear days", the words "ten clear days" 
shall be substituted. 

(iiü) in sub-clause (3) for the words "twenty-five clear days", the words "seven clear 
days shall be substituted. 

(iv) in sub-clause (4) for the words "ifteen clear days", the words "five clear days" 
shall be substituted. 

(v) in sub-clause (5) for the words "five clear days", the words "three clear days" 
shall be substituted. 

(3) After clause 97 of the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for conduct of 
business at the meetings of the authorities of the University) Uniform Statute, 2019, the 
following clause shall be inserted namely : 

98. mode of delivery for notice of meeting : 
Notice of meeting of all the authorities of the University, served to the concerned 

members through letter or e-mail or whatsapp or short messaging service (sms), will 
be deemed to be properly delivered. 

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra, 

AJIT BAWISKAR, 
Deputy Secretary to Government. 

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR 

HUPENDRA DINESH MORE. PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD 

MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS 

<l-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE. 



{ "type": "Form", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Form", "isBackSide": false }

