RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/37831

R EINLAIRE RS P
STTENUT WRT TR-§

¥ ¢, 3iwh %3(3)] THAR, & 3, 2033/ 3TIE QR, T 3%y [y 3, fma : 372 2.00

STHTHRUT thHTh %0

Tferehe WehToT=

WERTE VAT HERT, SAfuf-rami-ad aar et
(VT T, Uh- 31 NTOT -1 gl ufivg et fraw @ sy aisatafiem) frag a s,

Iea q aF freror fawmr
A, TS HET A0, T IS <,
'ﬂaﬁ\&oo 03, foin 3 ﬂa R0R3.

, sfergEAT
WERT, Wiasieh faemdis sfafram, qo4s.

FAih GRA. 02/ . /-3, — TRRTE GEse faamdie sfufEm, 0eg (09w =T Wl §)
IreT FHeTd 9% o Y-l (4 ) T FeA 03 o Te-The (o) AigR WSH FIUATT TIedT SIIHRIT AR
FEqgdren Haferd ey uRfam fafed w8a o1=, THe oRFEW, 038R LA WIGICHHN! GUROT 1 R :—

. I IRFEHY, HERTE Trdsii-eh foemiis (farndis witemuie Sesimdic et SeavasTaa=a
FrTgd) (ufeel QuROn) wHEy oRfEW, 2033 3 R,

R. NI Qiaufes faemdis (faemdis witemuie Sasintic s Srefavaeade HRTgd )
THET IRIFEH 02¢, AT e ] WEA Wiy ) Seel 0T A 3T —

(2) Ure-em ¢ A “aredid quf feae” At “dur quf fea)” o7 aget Uvaa 3 IR,
() We-shem 3 Wefler “dra ot " Yah “geT Ut e ST wee U A o,
(3) We-herw 3 i “derelte ot feer@” Tt Wi Qo foe” ST 95 A AW I,
() Gre-He ¥ Hie “Gerr ot feaq” Yot “orr qof fee” o 9t Soa A AR,
(4) We-Fem 4 wdier “gra gl feae” Yt “dF fad” 3r See FRU 39 o

(%)
9N IR--RF0--7,



WERTS VT TT0 SRTIRUT S -, e 3, 033/ 3T ¢R, Th 2 3¥Y

1. TR G fredts (i s daaieier e ST FEEd)
&Y IRIEH, 02%, IFAT HeAq %wwmwgcmmmaﬂaﬂ%:—

R¢. SHE T oA hEvEd —
mwmmwwmﬁmmmmmww
VT A1 WEANH JuAT AR o gEr A fen 2uard R A .

TRRTT TS AT SRATAR @ A,

arfsra anfawa,
I 39 gfaa.



HERTR, VIR THYN STRTUROT WIT GR-8, e 3, 3032/37THIE £3, ek £ %Y
HIGHER AND TECHNICAL EDUCATION DEPARTMENT

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, Dated the 3rd July 2023.

NOTIFICATION

MAHARASHTRA PuBLIic UNIVERSITIES Act, 2016.

No. Parini-2018/C.R.89/UE-2.— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (10) of
section 72 read with sub-section (5) of section 71 of the Maharashtra Public Universities Act,
2016 (Mah.VI of 2017) the Government of Maharashtra hereby amends the Maharashtra Public
Universities (Procedure for conduct of business at the Meetings of Authorities of the University)
Uniform Statute, 2019, as follows, namely :— )

(I) This Statute may be called as the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for
conduct of business at the meetings of the Authorities of the University) (First Amendment)
Uniform Statute, 2023.

(2) In clause 2 of the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for conduct of business
at the meetings of the authorities of the University) Uniform Statute, 2019,—

(i) in sub-clause (1) for the words “forty clear days”, the words “fifteen clear days”
shall be substituted.

(#1) in sub-clause (2) for the words “thirty clear days”, the words “ten clear days”
shall be substituted.

(Zif) in sub-clause (3) for the words “twenty-five clear days”, the words “seven clear
days” shall be substituted.

(iv) in sub-clause (4) for the words “fifteen clear days”, the words “five clear days”
shall be substituted.

(v) in sub-clause (5) for the words “five clear days”, the words “three clear days”
shall be substituted.

(3) After clause 97 of the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for conduct of
business at the meetings of the authorities of the University) Uniform Statute, 2019, the

following clause shall be inserted namely :—
98. mode of delivery for notice of meeting :—

Notice of meeting of all the authorities of the University, served to the concerned
members through letter or e-mail or whatsapp or short messaging service (sms), will

be deemed to be properly delivered.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

AJIT BAWISKAR,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PHINTING, STATIONERY AND "U?H?QEO?E A NETAJL SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD:
=D AT GOVEANMENT GENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NEIAS ' '
HUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVI ANMENT ClI Ng]OVEHNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBL'CATlONS,

MU | E T DIRECTORATE OF GOVI
21-xquAér:S?SSgaAgﬁDﬂngLésl-ﬂ%DNI/?-lOAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.





{ "type": "Form", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Form", "isBackSide": false }

